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The lead article in the October 2004 issue of Architectural Record, devoted to contemporary museums, noted
that museums continue to proliferate across the international landscape, leading to the conclusion that, post-
Bilbao, every municipality seems to want a smash. Certainly, following the opening of Frank Gehry's
Guggenheim Museum Bilbao, museums gained a newfound cache among architects and clients. The mission
and purpose of the museum is rapidly evolving: museums today are frequently more than repositories for
historical art: they can be research centers, memorials, contemporary galleries, or site-specific artworks in
themselves. New Museums documents the best of new museum design and features 27 projects in 13
countries in Europe, the United States, Israel, and Japan. The architects represented are among the most
renowned practitioners in the world today; in addition to those mentioned above, they include van Berkel +
Bos, Santiago Calatrava, Zaha Hadid, Kengo Kuma, and Alvaro Siza, as well as lesser-known, talented
designers such as Zvi Hecker in Israel and Diener & Diener in Switzerland. precedents as well as current
themes relevant to museum design: the museum as a neutral container, its role in placing art in context, the
museum as an addition to an existing building, and as a distinct work of art. drawings, and a project
description.
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From reader reviews:

Dorothy Guillen:

Now a day individuals who Living in the era exactly where everything reachable by connect with the internet
and the resources in it can be true or not demand people to be aware of each facts they get. How individuals
to be smart in acquiring any information nowadays? Of course the correct answer is reading a book.
Studying a book can help folks out of this uncertainty Information mainly this New Museums book because
book offers you rich details and knowledge. Of course the details in this book hundred per cent guarantees
there is no doubt in it you probably know this.

Jeffrey Primo:

Spent a free a chance to be fun activity to do! A lot of people spent their down time with their family, or their
friends. Usually they performing activity like watching television, gonna beach, or picnic within the park.
They actually doing same thing every week. Do you feel it? Would you like to something different to fill
your free time/ holiday? Could possibly be reading a book can be option to fill your totally free time/
holiday. The first thing you will ask may be what kinds of e-book that you should read. If you want to test
look for book, may be the guide untitled New Museums can be great book to read. May be it could be best
activity to you.

Marsha Young:

You can find this New Museums by check out the bookstore or Mall. Just simply viewing or reviewing it
could to be your solve problem if you get difficulties for your knowledge. Kinds of this e-book are various.
Not only by means of written or printed and also can you enjoy this book by means of e-book. In the modern
era like now, you just looking by your mobile phone and searching what your problem. Right now, choose
your own personal ways to get more information about your guide. It is most important to arrange you to
ultimately make your knowledge are still update. Let's try to choose correct ways for you.

Philip Brown:

That guide can make you to feel relax. That book New Museums was vibrant and of course has pictures on
there. As we know that book New Museums has many kinds or variety. Start from kids until teenagers. For
example Naruto or Private eye Conan you can read and believe you are the character on there. So , not at all
of book tend to be make you bored, any it can make you feel happy, fun and rest. Try to choose the best book
for you and try to like reading that.
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