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New stationary phases for high performance liquid chromatography has been prepared by the reaction of
Bromophenol blue salt solution with Amberlite CG-400 (Cl-) resin . The stability of the new attached
functional group on the resin was studied against different solvents such as benzene, ethanol, acetonitrile,
acetone, methanol, chloroform, and petroleum ether as well as NaOH and HCl solutions. The new prepared
resin was found stable and no depletion of the Bromophenol blue moity from the resin was noticed with the
above materials .The FTIR analysis has configured the attachment of Bromophenol on the resin as well as
the physical appearance of the new resins. The new stationary phase has been packed into stainless steel
column. The resin capacity of newly prepared resin has calculated. The resin capacity for the Amberlite-
bromophenol blue salt was found to average 5.27 meq./g which is more than the Amberlite resin, 3.95
meq./g.
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From reader reviews:

Melanie Tuck:

Now a day folks who Living in the era everywhere everything reachable by talk with the internet and the
resources within it can be true or not demand people to be aware of each info they get. How people have to
be smart in acquiring any information nowadays? Of course the reply is reading a book. Reading a book can
help men and women out of this uncertainty Information particularly this High Performance Liquid
Chromatography: New Column For High Performance Liquid Chromatography (HPLC) book since this
book offers you rich info and knowledge. Of course the knowledge in this book hundred per cent guarantees
there is no doubt in it you know.

John Whetstone:

The book with title High Performance Liquid Chromatography: New Column For High Performance Liquid
Chromatography (HPLC) has a lot of information that you can discover it. You can get a lot of advantage
after read this book. This kind of book exist new understanding the information that exist in this publication
represented the condition of the world currently. That is important to yo7u to find out how the improvement
of the world. That book will bring you within new era of the globalization. You can read the e-book in your
smart phone, so you can read the idea anywhere you want.

Gerald Sosa:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray you actually, why because this High Performance Liquid
Chromatography: New Column For High Performance Liquid Chromatography (HPLC) book written by
well-known writer we are excited for well how to make book that could be understand by anyone who read
the book. Written throughout good manner for you, dripping every ideas and producing skill only for
eliminate your own hunger then you still doubt High Performance Liquid Chromatography: New Column
For High Performance Liquid Chromatography (HPLC) as good book not merely by the cover but also by
content. This is one guide that can break don't judge book by its handle, so do you still needing one more
sixth sense to pick this particular!? Oh come on your looking at sixth sense already said so why you have to
listening to one more sixth sense.

Gwendolyn Smith:

What is your hobby? Have you heard in which question when you got pupils? We believe that that question
was given by teacher with their students. Many kinds of hobby, Every person has different hobby. And also
you know that little person just like reading or as examining become their hobby. You need to understand
that reading is very important in addition to book as to be the point. Book is important thing to provide you
knowledge, except your personal teacher or lecturer. You discover good news or update about something by
book. Amount types of books that can you choose to adopt be your object. One of them is this High
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